
        
 
Johnson & Johnson Announces Collaboration between Janssen and USAID to Expand Access to Anti-

Multidrug-Resistant Tuberculosis (MDR-TB) Compound  
 

Memorandum of Understanding Signed to Address the Global Health Threat of Antibiotic-Resistant Bacteria 
 

New Brunswick, NJ – Dec. 11, 2014 /PRNewswire/ – Johnson & Johnson today announced that its affiliate 
Janssen Therapeutics, Division of Janssen Products, LP (Janssen), has signed a Memorandum of 
Understanding (MOU) representing the intention of the Company along with the United States Agency for 
International Development (USAID) to step up the fight against the health threat of antibiotic-resistant bacteria. 
 
Antimicrobial resistance – and specifically that seen in multidrug-resistant tuberculosis (MDR-TB) – is one of the 
world’s most serious public health threats. MDR-TB is resistant to at least two of the four most commonly used 
medicines in today’s standard treatment regimen.i Treatment is typically lengthy and complex, ii with an average 
48 percent treatment success rate.iii 
 
Under the MOU, Janssen would contribute an estimated $30 million worth of its anti-MDR-TB treatment, about 
30,000 courses. USAID will work with their implementing partners, national TB programs and with Janssen to 
ensure responsible access and appropriate use of the treatment. This commitment builds upon and strengthens 
the Company’s agreement with the Stop TB Partnership’s Global Drug Facility to facilitate access to quality-
assured medicines in more than 100 countries worldwide. Over the coming months, Janssen and USAID will 
engage with the global TB community to solicit support, develop eligibility criteria and engage others to help 
address this public health crisis.  

 
“Our work to combat the scourge of multidrug-resistant tuberculosis is far from over,” said Dr. Paul Stoffels, chief 
scientific officer and worldwide chairman, Pharmaceuticals, Johnson & Johnson. “With nearly half a million 
people affected worldwide and approximately 210,000 losing their lives to this disease in 2013, we are engaging 
in pioneering partnerships with likeminded stakeholders invested in global public health. Collaborating with 
USAID improves access to potentially lifesaving medicines for people living with MDR-TB.” 
 
Despite the development of new MDR-TB treatment options, the ability to scale up the appropriate use of 
treatment regimens remains very challenging given weak health care infrastructures, which typically exist in 
vulnerable countries. However, in order to prevent further resistance, it is essential to ensure responsible access 
to new treatment options in these countries, including accurate diagnosis and documentation of use and impact.  
 
“USAID is pioneering a new model of development – one grounded in public-private partnerships that can 
unlock unprecedented resources and opportunities for the world's most vulnerable people," said Dr. Rajiv Shah, 
USAID administrator. "By working alongside a global community of innovators, entrepreneurs and scientists, we 
can help break the cycle of extreme poverty and save millions of people from preventable disease."  
 
Johnson & Johnson is committed to advancing global health. Its Family of Companies has launched and 
continues to support a variety of comprehensive efforts toward strengthening the health of communities, 
improving maternal and child health and preventing the spread of infectious and preventable diseases 
worldwide. For more information on Johnson & Johnson global public health programs, visit www.jnj.com. 
 
About the Janssen Pharmaceutical Companies of Johnson & Johnson 
 
The Janssen Pharmaceutical Companies of Johnson & Johnson are dedicated to addressing and solving the 
most important unmet medical needs of our time, including oncology (e.g., multiple myeloma and prostate 
cancer), immunology (e.g., rheumatoid arthritis, inflammatory bowel disease and psoriasis), neuroscience (e.g., 
schizophrenia, dementia and pain), infectious diseases (e.g., HIV/AIDS, hepatitis C and tuberculosis), and 
cardiovascular and metabolic diseases (e.g., diabetes). 
 

http://www.jnj.com/


Driven by our commitment to patients, we develop sustainable, integrated health care solutions by working side-
by-side with health care stakeholders, based on partnerships of trust and transparency. To learn more, visit 
www.janssen.com. 
 
About Johnson & Johnson 
 
Caring for the world one person at a time inspires and unites the people of Johnson & Johnson. We embrace 
research and science – bringing innovative ideas, products and services to advance the health and well-being of 
people. Our approximately 126,000 employees at more than 270 Johnson & Johnson operating companies work 
with partners in health care to touch the lives of over a billion people every day, throughout the world.   
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